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 City of Willow Park 
Regular Meeting  Agenda 

Municipal Complex 
516 Ranch House Rd, Willow Park, TX 76087 

Tuesday, July 10, 2018 at 7:00 p.m. 
 
 
Call to Order  

Determination of Quorum 

Invocation & Pledge of Allegiance 

Pastor Jon Sherman, Trinity Bible Church, will be conducting our invocation and pledge to the U.S. flag.  

Presentations & Proclamations 

1. Oath of office for newly appointed Place 4 Councilmember, Lea Young.  
 

Public Comments (Limited to five minutes per person)   

Residents may address the Council regarding an item that is not listed on the agenda. Residents 
must complete a speaker form and turn it in to the Secretary five (5) minutes before the start of 
the meeting. The Rules of Procedure states that comments are to be limited to five (5) minutes. 
The Texas Open Meetings Act provides the following: 

(a) If, at a meeting of a governmental body, a member of the public or of the governmental 
body inquiries about a subject for which notice has not been given as required by this 
subchapter, the notice provisions of this subchapter do not apply to:  

(1) A statement of specific factual information given in response to the inquiry; or  
(2) A recitation of existing policy in response to the inquiry.  

(b) Any deliberation of or decision about the subjectof the inquiry shall be limited to a proposal 
to place the subject on the agenda for a subsequent meeting. 

Consent Agenda  

All matters listed in the Consent Agenda are considered to be routine by the City Council and 
will be enacted by one motion. There will not be a separate discussion of these items. If 
discussion is desired, that item will be removed from the consent agenda and will be considered 
separately.  

A. Approve City Council Meeting Minutes – June 12 and July 2, 2018 

Regular Agenda Items 
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1. Discussion/ Presentation from staff regarding the City’s water supply, storage and 

distribution.   
 

2. Discussion/ Action: To consider and take action on a Final Plat of Lots 1-4 Block 3, Lots 
1-58 Block 4, Lot 1 X Block 4, the Village at Willow Park Subdivision, being 14.05 acres 
in the J. Cole Survey, Abstract 218; J.S. Oxer Survey, Abstract 1029, and A.J. Hood 
Survey, Abstract 2587, City of Willow Park, Parker County, Texas. 
 

3. Discussion/ Action: To consider and take action on a Site Plan for Lot 3, Block 3, The 
Village at Willow Park and the parking lot adjacent to Willow Crossing Dr. 
 

4. Discussion/ Action: To consider and take action on a request to rezone from PD-EC 
Planned Development-Event Center to PD-SF Planned Development-Single Family, 
11.79 acre tract of land being part of a 140.3 acre tract of land A McCarver Survey, 
Abstract 910, the W. Franklin Survey, Abstract 468, the I. Hendley Survey, Abstract 
619, the M. Edwards Survey, Abstract 1955, and the J. Froman Survey, Abstract 471, 
all in Parker County, Texas, being a portion of the certain tract described in DOC. # 
201612056, Official Public Records, Parker County, Texas. Located north of 1-20 
Service Road between Kings Gated Road and Crown Pointe Blvd. 
 

a. Open Public Hearing 
b. Close Public Hearing  
c. Adopt Ordinance 773-18 

 
5. Discussion/ Action: To consider and take action on a Site Plan for Lot 11, Block B, 

Crown Pointe Addition. 
 

6. Discussion/ Action: To consider and take action Ordinance 772-18, an ordinance 
suspending the 2018 rate case filing of Texas Gas Service Company, for natural 
gas service within the City of Willow Park, Texas and declaring this ordinance to 
be a 90-day suspension added to the original 35-day review period of the 2018 
rate case.  
 

7. Discussion/ Action: To consider and take action on Resolution 2018-07, naming the City 
Secretary as Public Information Officer.  
 

8. Discussion/ Action: To consider and take action on a Bank Depository Contract. 
 

9. Discussion/ Action: To consider and take action on all matters incident and related to 
the issuance of “City of Willow Park, Texas, Tax Notes, Series 2018A”, including the 
adoption of an ordinance authorizing the issuance of such tax notes.  
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10. Discussion/ Action: To consider and take action on awarding the contract for the Public 
Safety Building.  
 

11. Discussion/ Action: To consider and take action on setting the date, time and 
place of Public Hearings for the FY 2018-19 Budget and adoption of the FY 
2018-19 Budget and Tax Rate.   
 

12. Discussion/ Action: To consider and take action on Ordinance 766-18, 
establishing and designating a school zone for McCall Elementary and 
establishing a speed limit of 20 miles per hour for the school zone.  
 

13. Discussion/ Action: To consider and take action on Ordinance 765-18, an 
ordinance amending Chapter 12 “Traffic and Vehicles”, of the Code of 
Ordinances of the City of Willow Park establishing a speed limit of 30 miles per 
hour for City streets, including “Local Residential Streets.”  
 

14. Discussion/ Action: To consider and take action on award of Pump Station and 
Tank Improvements contract to the low bidder, TTE, LLC, for the base bid 
amount of $381,805.00 and a change order deduction in the amount of 
$66,900.00 for a final contract price of $314,905.00. 
 

Executive Session  

§ 551.071. Texas Government Code. Consultation with Attorney. The City Council 
may convene in executive session to conduct a private consultation with its attorney on 
any legally posted agenda item, when the City Council seeks the advice of its attorney 
about pending or contemplated litigation, a settlement offer, or on a matter in which the 
duty of the attorney to the governmental body under the Texas Disciplinary Rules of 
Professional Conduct of the State Bar of Texas clearly conflicts with the provisions of 
Chapter 551, including the following items: 

A. Any Posted Item 

Informational 

A. Mayor & Council Member Comments 
 

B. City Manager’s Comments 

Adjournment 
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I certify that the above notice of this meeting posted on the bulletin board at the 
municipal complex of the City of Willow Park, Texas on or before July 6, 2018 at 5:00 
p.m. 
 
 
____________________________________ 
Alicia Smith TRMC, CMC 
City Secretary 
 
If you plan to attend this public meeting and you have a disability that requires special 
arrangements at this meeting, please contact City Secretary’s Office at (817) 441-7108 
ext. 6 or fax (817) 441-6900 at least two (2) working days prior to the meeting so that 
appropriate arrangements can be made. 

 
 
 

This public notice was removed from the official 
posting board at the Willow Park City Hall on the 
following date and time: 
______________________________ 
By: ___________________________ 
City Secretary’s Office 
City of Willow Park, Texas 
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 City of Willow Park 
Regular Council Meeting Minutes 

Municipal Complex 
516 Ranch House Rd, Willow Park, TX 76087 

Tuesday, June 12, 2018 at 7:30 p.m. 
 
 
Call to Order  

Mayor Moss called the meeting to order at 7:30 pm.  

 

Determination of Quorum 

Present:  

Mayor Doyle Moss 

Councilmember Norman Hogue 

Councilmember Amy Fennell 

Councilmember Gholson 

Councilmember Gary McKaughan  

Councilmember Greg Runnebaum 

 

Staff Present:  

City Administrator Bryan Grimes 

City Secretary Alicia Smith  

City Attorney Pat Chesser 

 

Invocation & Pledge of Allegiance 

David Green, Pastor, Christ Chapel Church, led the invocation and pledge to the U.S. flag.  

 

Presentations & Proclamations 

A. Mayor Moss read a proclamation recognizing retiring councilmember John Gholson.   

 

Public Comments 

Citizens participating:  
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None 

 

Consent Agenda  

A. Approve City Council Meeting Minutes – May 15, 2018 

Motion made by Councilmember Fennell 

To approve the minutes from the May 15 2018, meeting.  

Seconded by Councilmember McKaughan 

Aye votes: Councilmembers Hogue, Fennell, Runnebaum and McKaughan 

Motion passed with a vote of 4-0 

 

Regular Agenda Items 

1. Motion made by Councilmember Runnebaum  

To accept the resignation of Councilmember Gholson.  

Seconded by Councilmember Gholson 

Aye votes: Councilmembers Hogue, Fennell, Runnebaum and McKaughan 

Motion passed with a vote of 4-0 

 

2. Motion made by Councilmember  

To appoint Larry Johnson to the Parks Board.   

Seconded by Councilmember McKaughan 

Aye votes: Councilmembers Hogue, Fennell, Runnebaum and McKaughan 

Motion passed with a vote of 4-0 

 

Motion made by Councilmember McKaughan 

To appoint William “Billy” Weikert to the Planning and Zoning Commission, Place 3 

and Ronald “Scott” Smith to the Planning and Zoning Commission, alternate 1.  

Seconded by Councilmember Norman Hogue 

Aye votes: Councilmembers Hogue, Fennell, Runnebaum and McKaughan 

Motion passed with a vote of 4-0 
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3. Motion made by Councilmember McKaughan 

To accept the Final Plat of Lot 4R-1R, 4R-2R and Lot 5; Block A; Crown Pointe 

Addition Phase II. 

Seconded by Councilmember Fennell 

Aye votes: Councilmembers Hogue, Fennell, Runnebaum and McKaughan 

Motion passed with a vote of 4-0 

 

4. Motion made by Councilmember Runnebaum 

To approve a Site Plan for professional office building on Lot 2, 3, 4; Block 1, WAM 

Addition. 

Seconded by Councilmember McKaughan 

Aye votes: Councilmembers Hogue, Fennell, Runnebaum and McKaughan  

Motion passed with a vote of 4-0 

 

5. Public Hearing was opened at 7:42 pm 

Public Hearing was closed at 7:42 pm 

 

Motion made by Councilmember Fennell 

To approve a request for a Special Use Permit to operate and expand a Masonry supply 

store and warehouse in the Commercial/IH-20 Overlay District on Lot 1, Block 1, Bell 

Natural Stone Addition located at 4801 E IH-20 Service Road. 

Seconded by Councilmember Hogue 

Aye votes: Councilmembers Hogue, Fennell, Runnebaum and McKaughan  

Motion passed with a vote of 4-0 

 

6. Public Hearing was opened at 7:46 pm 

Public Hearing was closed at 7:46 pm 

 

Motion made by Councilmember Fennell 
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To approve Ordinance 770-18, a zoning change from R-1 Single Family/IH-20 Overlay 

District to C Commercial/IH-20 Overlay District, on a 15.67 acre tract of land in the 

David Addington Survey, Abstract No. 21, City of Willow Park, Parker County, Texas, 

located between the IH-20 Service Road and Bankhead Hwy. east of Clear Fork Circle. 

Seconded by Councilmember Runnebaum  

Aye votes: Councilmembers Hogue, Fennell, Runnebaum and McKaughan  

Motion passed with a vote of 4-0 

 

7. Motion made by Councilmember McKaughan 

To accept a Final Plat Crown Bluff Addition a 15.69-acre tract of land, David Addington 

Survey, Abstract No. 21, City of Willow Park, Parker County, Texas. 

Seconded by Councilmember Runnebaum 

Aye votes: Councilmembers Hogue, Fennell, Runnebaum and McKaughan 

Motion passed with a vote of 4-0 

 

8. Motion made Councilmember Runnebaum 

To implement Stage 2 Water Conservation. 

Seconded by Councilmember McKaughan 

Aye votes: Councilmembers Hogue, Fennell, Runnebaum and McKaughan 

Motion passed with a vote of 4-0 

 

9. Motion made by Councilmember Fennell 

To give the Public Works Director authority to implement Water Conservation Stages as 

necessary.  

 Seconded by Councilmember Runnebaum 

Aye votes: Councilmembers Hogue, Fennell, Runnebaum and McKaughan  

Motion passed with a vote of 4-0 
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10. Motion made by Councilmember Runnebaum 

To hire Retail Coach as the City’s Economic Development consulting firm.  

Seconded by Councilmember Hogue 

Aye votes: Councilmembers Hogue, Fennell, Runnebaum and McKaughan  

Motion passed with a vote of 4-0 

 

11.  Tabled until next meeting  

 

12. Motion made by Councilmember  

To appoint Halff Associates, Inc, Norton, Rose, Fulbright and Hilltop Securities as 

Engineering, Bond Counsel, and Financial Advisory firms for the Water Supply 

Improvements project funded by the Texas Water Development Board Drinking Water 

State Revolving Fund and as required for obtaining a water supply from the City of Fort 

Worth. 

Seconded by Councilmember Hogue 

Aye votes: Councilmembers Hogue, Fennell, Runnebaum and McKaughan  

Motion passed with a vote of 4-0 

 

 

 

Adjournment 

Motion made by Councilmember Runnebaum 

To adjourn 

Seconded by Councilmember Fennell 

Aye votes: Councilmembers Hogue, Fennell, Runnebaum and McKaughan  

Motion passed with a vote of 4-0 
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APPROVED: 
 
___________________________ 

Doyle Moss, Mayor 
City of Willow Park, Texas    ATTEST: 

____________________________ 

Alicia Smith TRMC CMC, City 
Secretary  
City of Willow Park, Texas 
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 City of Willow Park 
Regular Council Meeting Minutes 

Municipal Complex 
516 Ranch House Rd, Willow Park, TX 76087 

Monday, July 2, 2018 at 6:00 p.m. 
 
 
Call to Order  

Mayor Moss called the meeting to order at 6:00 pm.  

 

Determination of Quorum 

Present:  

Mayor Doyle Moss 

Councilmember Norman Hogue 

Councilmember Amy Fennell 

Councilmember Gary McKaughan  

Councilmember Greg Runnebaum 

 

Staff Present:  

City Administrator Bryan Grimes 

City Secretary Alicia Smith  

City Attorney Pat Chesser 

 

Executive Session began at 6:02PM 

 

Executive Session ended at 6: 50PM 

 

Regular Agenda Items 

1. Motion made by Councilmember Fennell 

To appoint Lea Young to the City of Willow Park City Council, Place 4. 

Seconded by Councilmember Runnebaum 

Aye votes: Councilmembers Hogue, Fennell, Runnebaum and McKaughan 
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Motion passed with a vote of 4-0 

 

 

 

Adjournment 

Motion made by Councilmember Runnebaum 

To adjourn 

Seconded by Councilmember Fennell 

Aye votes: Councilmembers Hogue, Fennell, Runnebaum and McKaughan  

Motion passed with a vote of 4-0 

 

 

APPROVED: 
 
___________________________ 

Doyle Moss, Mayor 
City of Willow Park, Texas    ATTEST: 

____________________________ 

Alicia Smith TRMC CMC, City 
Secretary  
City of Willow Park, Texas 



7/6/2018 

CITY COUNCIL AGENDA ITEM BRIEFING SHEET 
 

AGENDA ITEM:   
 

1. Discussion/ Presentation from staff regarding the City’s water supply, storage and 
distribution.   

       _________________________   
BACKGROUND: 
 
 Staff  will provide an update on the current water situation and a plan of action.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
              
STAFF/BOARD/COMMISSION RECOMMENDATION: 
 
              
EXHIBITS:    
 
 
 

ADDITIONAL INFO: 
 

FINANCIAL INFO:  
Cost $ 

Source of 
Funding 

$ 

  
  
  

 

Council Date: Department: Presented By: 
July 10, 2018 Administrative Bryan Grimes 























































































































































7/6/2018 

CITY COUNCIL AGENDA ITEM BRIEFING SHEET 
 

AGENDA ITEM:   
To consider and take action on Resolution 2018-07, naming the City Secretary as Public 
Information Officer. 
              
BACKGROUND: 
 
The Public Information Officer is primarily responsible for administering the 
responsibilities of the public official or governmental body under The Texas Public 
Information Act (PIA)  and chapter 552 of the Texas Local Government Code. 
 
A Public Information Officer provides uniformity in application, operation and 
interpretation of the Public Information Act and the City’s associated policies.   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
              
STAFF/BOARD/COMMISSION RECOMMENDATION: 
To approve Resolution 2018-07.  
              
EXHIBITS:    
 
 
 

ADDITIONAL INFO: 
 

FINANCIAL INFO:  
Cost $ 

Source of 
Funding 

$ 

  
  
  

 

Council Date: Department: Presented By: 
July 10, 2018 Legislative A. Smith 
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DESIGNATION PUBLIC INFORMATION OFFICER 
 

CITY OF WILLOW PARK, TEXAS 
RESOLUTION NO. 2018- 07 

 
A RESOLUTION OF THE OF THE CITY OF WILLOW PARK, TEXAS, 
DESIGNATING A PUBLIC INFORMATION COORDINATOR TO SATISFY THE 
TRAINING REQUIREMENTS OF TEXAS GOVERNMENT SECTION 552.012.    
 
WHEREAS, Texas Government Code § 552.012 requires each elected or appointed 
public official who is: (1) a member of a multimember governmental body;                      
(2) the governing officer of a governmental body that is headed by a single officer rather 
than by a multimember governing body; or (3) the officer for public information of a 
governmental body, to complete a course of training of at least one hour regarding the 
responsibilities of the governmental body with which the official serves and its officers 
and employees under the Texas Public Information Act; and 
 
WHEREAS, Texas Government Code § 552.012(c) authorizes a public official to 
designate a “public information coordinator” to satisfy the training requirements for the 
public official if the public information coordinator is primarily responsible for 
administering the responsibilities of the public official or governmental body under the 
Texas Public Information Act; and 
 
WHEREAS, designation of a public information coordinator does not relieve a public 
official from the duty to comply with any other requirement of the Texas Public 
Information Act that applies to the public official; and   
 
WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Willow Park believes that it is to the 
advantage of the city to designate a public information coordinator to satisfy the training 
requirement of Texas Government Code Section 552.012 in lieu of all of the city’s public 
officials taking the training; and 
 
WHEREAS, all of the city’s public officials may still take the training at their option. 
 
NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
WILLOW PARK, TEXAS: 
 

1. Pursuant to Texas Government Code § 552.012(c), the City of Willow Park__ 
hereby designates a public information coordinator to satisfy the training 
requirements of Texas Government Code Section 552.012 for all of the city’s 
public officials who are subject to such requirements. 

 
2. That the following person is designated as the city’s public information 

coordinator:  City of Willow Park City Secretary. 
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DESIGNATION PUBLIC INFORMATION OFFICER 
 

3. That the city’s public information coordinator is primarily responsible for 
administering the responsibilities of the city’s public officials under the Texas 
Public Information Act. 

 
4. That the city’s public information coordinator shall complete the training course 

regarding the responsibilities of the city’s public officials under the Texas Public 
Information Act not later than the 90th day after the date the coordinator assumes 
the his or her duties as coordinator. 

 
PASSED AND APPROVED this 10th day of July, 2018 
 
 
 
______________________ 
Doyle Moss, Mayor 
 
ATTEST: 
 
 
______________________ 
Alicia Smith, City Secretary 
 
APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
 
 
____________________________ 
William Pat Chesser, City Attorney 
 
 
The Willow Park City Council is acting on Resolution No. 2018-07, did on the 10th day of 
July 2018 vote as  follows: 
 
    FOR             AGAINST             ABSTAIN 
 
Doyle Moss   _____  _____   _____ 

Norman Hogue, Place 1 _____  _____   _____ 

Amy Fennell, Place 2  _____  _____   _____ 

Greg Runnebaum, Place 3 _____  _____   _____ 

Lea Young, Place 4  _____  _____   _____  

Gary McKaughan, Place 5 _____  _____   _____ 

 



7/6/2018 

CITY COUNCIL AGENDA ITEM BRIEFING SHEET 
 

AGENDA ITEM:   
 
Designation of Depository 
              
BACKGROUND:  
 
As authorized by City Council on May 15, 2018 an RFP was issued for Depository Services for 
the City of Willow Park. The only responder to this RFP was First Financial Bank.  
 
The City has been with First Financial Bank since it’s designation as the depository in September 
of 2015. The bid from First Financial is essentially the same as the awarded bid in 2015. First 
Financial Bank has been a good fit for the City and has gone out of its way to accommodate the 
City’s desires and requests. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
              
STAFF/BOARD/COMMISSION RECOMMENDATION:  
 
It is Staff’s recommendation that the City Council re-designate First Financial Bank to serve as 
the depository for the municipality’s funds. 
              
EXHIBITS:   
 
 
 
 

ADDITIONAL INFO: 
 

FINANCIAL INFO:  
Cost $  

Source of Funding $  
  
  
  

 

Council Date: Department: Presented By: 
07/10/18 Finance Candy Scott 































ORDINANCE NO. 773-18 

AN ORDINANCE authorizing the issuance of "CITY OF WILLOW PARK, TEXAS, 
TAX NOTES, SERIES 2018A"; specifying the terms and features of said 
notes; levying a continuing direct annual ad valorem tax for the payment 
of said notes; and resolving other matters incident and related to the 
issuance, sale, payment and delivery of said notes, including the approval 
and execution of a Paying Agent/Registrar Agreement and a Note 
Purchase Agreement; and providing an effective date. 

WHEREAS, pursuant to Texas Government Code, Chapter 1431, as amended 
(hereinafter called the "Act»), the City Council is authorized and empowered to issue anticipation 
notes to pay contractual obligations to be incurred (i) for the construction of any public work and 
(ii) for the purchase of materials, supplies, equipment, machinery, buildings, lands and rights-of­
way for the City's authorized needs and purposes; and

WHEREAS, in accordance with the provisions of Act, the City Council hereby finds and 
determines that anticipation notes should be issued and sold at this time to finance the costs of 
paying contractual obligations to be incurred (i) for constructing, renovating, improving, 
expanding and equipping public safety facilities (police and fire), including related 
environmental, engineering, drainage and site work, and (ii) to pay professional services 
rendered in relation to such projects and the financing thereof; now, therefore, 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF WILLOW PARK, TEXAS: 

SECTION 1: Authorization - Designatioh - Principal Amount - Purpose. Notes of the 
City shall be and are hereby authorized to be issued in the aggregate · principal amount of 
$640,000, to be designated and bear the title "CITY OF WILLOW PARK, TEXAS, TAX NOTES, 
SERIES 2018A" (hereinafter referred to as the "Note" or "Notes"), for the purpose of paying 
contractual obligations to be incurred (i) for constructing, renovating, improving, expanding and 
equipping public safety facilities (police and fire), including related environmental, engineering, 
drainage and site work, and (ii) to pay professional services rendered in relation to such projects 
and the financing thereof, in conformity with the Constitution and laws of the State of Texas, 
including the Act. 

SECTION 2: Fully Reaistered Obligations - Note Date - Authorized Denominations -
Stated Maturities - Interest Rate. The Notes shall be issued as a single fully registered 
obligation only, shall be dated July 1, 2018 (the "Note Date"), shall be in the denominations of 
$5,000 or any integral multiple thereof, and shall become due and payable finally on 
February 15, 2025 (the "Stated Maturity") with principal installments thereof to become due and 
payable on February 15 in each of the years in accordance with the following schedule: 

13osne3.211001033409 











































































7/6/2018 

CITY COUNCIL AGENDA ITEM BRIEFING SHEET 
 

 
AGENDA ITEM:   
 
10. Discussion/Action: To consider and take action on awarding the contract for the Public Safety 
Building. 
              
BACKGROUND: 
 
At time of Packet Submission - Staff is conducting background checks and doing its due diligence 
on the two lowest bidders for the Public Safety Building.  
 
              
STAFF/BOARD/COMMISSION RECOMMENDATION: 
 
Award the City of Willow Park’s Public Safety Building to Hasen Design. 
 
 
Motion if council chooses to award the Contract: 
 
I move to award the construction contract for the City's new Public Safety Building to the lowest, 
responsible bidder, Hasen Design Build and Development, in the amount of $ 4,717,750.00.  
 
 
 
              
EXHIBITS:    
 
Official Bid Summary from Dewberry Architects. 
 
 
 
 
 

ADDITIONAL INFO: 
 

FINANCIAL INFO:  
Cost $4,717,750.00 

Source of 
Funding 

City Bonds / Tax Notes 

  
  
  

 

Council Date: Department: Presented By: 
7-10-18 Development Services Bryan Grimes / Bernie Parker 



City of Willow Park, TX

Willow Park Public Saftey Building

BID SUMMARY DAI Project No. 50089183

Dewberry Project #: 50089183

CONTRACTORS: WILKS HASEN MYCON AUI RJM SCHMOLDT IMPERIAL TEINART JOE JONES

5% Bid Bond / Surety X X X X X X X X X

Bid Proposal Part A X X X X X X X X X

Alternates Form X X X X X X X X X

Acknowledgment of Addendums 2 & 3 X X

Total Base Bid 4,568,142.00$          4,589,000.00$          5,300,000.00$          4,665,000.00$          6,054,073.81$          4,870,000.00$          4,698,999.00$          5,100,000.00$          5,078,000.00$          

Days to Complete Base Bid 300 300 275 365 345 330 300 300 330

Additional Days to Complete Alt 1 10 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Additional Days to Complete Alt 2 4 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Total Days to complete - - - - - - - - -

ALTERNATES:

Alt. 1: Canopy at Secure Parking (Add) 135,151.00$              105,000.00$              321,400.00$              NO BID NO BID 108,700.00$              108,000.00$              NO BID NO BID

Alt. 2: Sidewalk along Stagecoach Trail (Add) 10,151.00$                12,500.00$                13,000.00$                2,964.00$                  2,750.00$                  15,000.00$                13,000.00$                7,900.00$                  12,800.00$                

Alt. 3: Sectional Doors in lieu of Bi-Fold doors 

at Apparatus Bays (Deduct) (96,000.00)$              (95,000.00)$              (126,000.00)$            (96,000.00)$              (96,000.00)$              (90,000.00)$              (90,000.00)$              (137,000.00)$            (60,500.00)$              

Alt. 4a: Upward Coiling Security Grilles at 

Apparatus Bays (Add) May 10, 2018 23,928.36$               11,444.00$               

Alt. 4b: Roll-up Mesh Doors at Apparatus Bay 

(Add) May 10, 2018 36,347.96$               17,444.00$               

Alt. 5: MEPCE Addendum #2 (Add) May 10, 

2018 29,682.00$                11,250.00$                

Addendum 3 May 11, 2018 No change No change

Base Bid + Accepted Alternates 1, 2, & 5 4,743,126.00$          4,717,750.00$          

 Jenna McGregor, AIA 

Project Manager
Dewberry Architects Inc.

Bid Date:  May  8, 2018 - 2:19 PM

We the undersigned Dewberry Architects Inc., hereby certify that this is the true and correct Summary of Bids received by City of Willow 

Park at the Willow Park Police and Fire Station, 101 Stagecoach Trail, Willow Park TX  on Tuesday, MAY 8, 2018 2:19 P.M.





7/6/2018 

CITY COUNCIL AGENDA ITEM BRIEFING SHEET 
 

AGENDA ITEM:   
School Zone speed limits – Scenic Drive   
              
BACKGROUND:  
 
The changes to the Ordinance will designate the school zone from 7 am to 9 am and 2 pm to 4 pm.  
This is a change from 7am to 4pm.  The change covers the peak ingress and egress times for the 
school.      
 
Signage is to be determined.   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
        
STAFF/BOARD/COMMISSION RECOMMENDATION:  
Recommend approving the item as submitted. 
 
              
EXHIBITS:   
 

ADDITIONAL INFO: 
 
 

FINANCIAL INFO:  
Cost $ 0.00 

Source of 
Funding 

$ 0.00 

  
  
  

 

Council Date: Department: Presented By: 

July 10, 2018 Police 
 
Chief Carrie West 
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SCHOOL ZONE 

CITY OF WILLOW PARK  
ORDINANCE 766-18 

 
AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF WILLOW PARK, TEXAS ESTABLISHING AND 
DESIGNATING A SCHOOL ZONE FOR MCCALL ELEMENTARY SCHOOL ALONG 
BOTH DIRECTIONS OF SCENIC TRAIL FROM A POINT WHERE SCENIC TRAIL 
AND TRICIA TRAIL INTERSECT WEST ALONG SCENIC TRAIL 2400 FEET AND 
BOTH DIRECTIONS OF TRICIA TRAIL FROM A POINT WHERE TRICIA TRAIL 
AND SCENIC TRAIL INTERSECT THEN SOUTH 900 FEET; ESTABLISHING A 
PRIMA FACIE SPEED LIMIT OF 20 MILES PER HOUR FOR THE MCCALL 
ELEMENTARY SCHOOL ZONE FOR THE POSTED TIME PERIODS OF 7:00 A.M. 
TO 9:00 A.M. AND 2:00 P.M. TO 4:00 P.M.; AUTHORIZING AND DIRECTING THE 
CITY MANAGER TO INSTALL SIGNAGE; PROVIDING A PENALTY; A 
REPEALER; AND SETTING AN EFFECTIVE DATE. 

 
WHEREAS, the City of Willow Park, TX is a municipal corporation organized under the 
laws of the State of Texas; and 
 
WHEREAS, it is the intent of the City of Willow Park to protect the health, safety and 
welfare and wellbeing of its citizens; and 

 
WHEREAS, the City, under powers delegated to it, pursuant to Chapter 51, TEX. LOCAL 
GOV'T CODE, has the authority to regulate traffic on its streets for the purpose of protecting 
public welfare and safety; and 

 
WHEREAS, the construction and opening of the McCall Elementary School, Aledo 
Independent School District, within the boundaries of the City, which is located generally 
at the intersection of Tricia Trail and Scenic Trail, has in attendance elementary school 
students; and 

 
WHEREAS, the ingress of elementary students and egress of elementary students from the 
school does create and cause a special hazard to exist with regard to traffic, pedestrian 
crossings and school attendee safety pursuant to §545.352 of the TEXAS 
TRANSPORTATION CODE; and 

 
WHEREAS, the City did, on the basis of a traffic analysis performed for and by the City, 
find that the prima facie speed limit of 20 miles per hour was determined and declared to be 
a prima facie reasonable and safe and prudent speed in the designated school zone. 

 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
WILLOW PARK, TEXAS: 
 
SECTION 1. AUTHORIZATION 
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The Mayor, or his designee, is hereby authorized and directed to implement the 
applicable provisions of this ordinance as relates to the enforcement of the speed zones 
contained therein, within the municipal boundaries of the City of Willow Park, Texas. 

 
SECTION 2. SCHOOL ZONE ESTABLISHMENT AND DESIGNATION  

 
School Zone - McCall Elementary School 

 
During posted hours as set forth below, a school zone is hereby established and designated 
for McCall Elementary School:  
 
Along both directions of Scenic Trail from a point where Scenic Trail and Tricia Trail 
intersect west along Scenic Trail 2400 feet. 
   

7:00 a.m. – 9:00 a.m. 
  2:00 p.m. – 4:00 p. m.  

 
Along both directions of Tricia Trail from a point where Tricia Trail and Scenic Trail intersect 
then south 900 feet. 

 
 7:00 a.m. – 9:00 a.m. 

2:00 p.m. – 4:00 p.m. 
 

 
SECTION 3.  ESTABLISHMENT OF PRIMA FACIE SPEED FOR SCHOOL ZONE 
 
The prima facie speed limit of 20 miles per hour for vehicles is hereby determined and 
declared to be a prima facie reasonable, prudent and safe speed limit which is hereby fixed 
for vehicles traveling within the established and designated school zone for McCall 
Elementary School during posted hours. 
 
SECTION 4. SIGNAGE 

 
By adoption of this Ordinance the City Council does hereby direct the City Manager to install 
signage consistent with the provisions herein that is in accordance with the manual on uniform 
traffic control devices as adopted by the Texas Department of Transportation. The provisions of 
the Ordinance enacted herein shall be enforceable upon the residential streets so designated upon 
the erection and placement of signage designating the speed limit on each street during the posted 
hours. 

 
SECTION 5. RECITALS 

 
The City Council hereby finds and declares all precatory language herein to be true and correct 
and approves and adopts the same herein as part of this Resolution. 
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SECTION 6. SEVERABILITY 
If for any reason any section, paragraph, subdivision, clause, phrase or provision of this Ordinance 
shall be held invalid, it shall not affect any valid provisions of this or any other Ordinance of the 
City of Willow Park to which these rules and regulations relate. 
 
SECTION 7. PENALTY 
 
A violation of any provision of this Ordinance shall be punishable by a fine of not less than $1.00 
nor more than $200.00 upon conviction. 

 
SECTION 8. REPEAL OF CONFLICTING ORDINANCES 

 
All Ordinances in conflict herewith be and the same are hereby repealed to the extent of such 
conflict. 

 
SECTION 9. EFFECTIVE DATE 

 
This Ordinance shall take effect on or after its publication in a newspaper of general publication 
stating its purpose and penalty. 
 

 PASSED AND APPROVED this 10th  day of July, 2018. 
 
 ______________________________ 
Doyle Moss, Mayor 

 
ATTEST: 
 
___________________________________ 
   Alicia Smith TRMC, City Secretary 
 
 
The Willow Park City Council is acting on Ordinance No. 766-18, did on the 10th  day of July 2018 
vote as follows: 
 
    FOR             AGAINST             ABSTAIN 
 
Doyle Moss   _____  _____   _____ 
Norman Hogue, Place 1 _____  _____   _____ 
Amy Fennell, Place 2  _____  _____   _____ 
Greg Runnebaum, Place 3 _____  _____   _____ 
Lea Young,  Place 4  _____  _____   _____  
Gary McKaughan, Place 5 _____  _____   _____ 



7/6/2018 

CITY COUNCIL AGENDA ITEM BRIEFING SHEET 
 

AGENDA ITEM:   
Speed limits within the City of Willow Park.   
              
BACKGROUND:  
 
The Ordinance currently in effect does not meet minimum state requirements regarding speed 
limits within the city limits.  Staff has presented a revision of the Ordinance that complies with 
Transportation Code Section 545.356, specifically, the speed limits on streets that have been 
previously designated 20 mph, should reflect the 30 mph prima facie.   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
        
STAFF/BOARD/COMMISSION RECOMMENDATION:  
Recommend approving the line items as submitted. 
 
              
EXHIBITS:   
 

ADDITIONAL INFO: 
 

FINANCIAL INFO:  
Cost $ 0.00 
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Funding 

$ 0.00 
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CITY OF WILLOW PARK 
ORDINANCE NO. 767-18 

 
AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 12 “TRAFFIC AND VEHICLES”, ARTICLE 
12.03 “OPERATION OF VEHICLES”, DIVISION 2. “SPEED LIMITS”, SECTIONS 
12.03.031 AND 12.03.032 OF THE CODE OF ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF WILLOW 
PARK, TEXAS; PROVIDING FOR A PRIMA FACIE SPEED LIMIT ON CITY STREETS 
AND ALLEYS, INCLUDING DESIGNATED “LOCAL RESIDENTIAL STREETS”; 
PROVIDING A PENALTY; A SEVERABILITY CLAUSE; A REPEALER; AND SETTING 
AN EFFECTIVE DATE. 
 
WHEREAS, the City of Willow Park is a municipal corporation organized under the laws of the 
State of Texas; and 
 
WHEREAS, it is intent of the City of Willow Park to protect the health, safety and welfare and 
well being of its citizens; and 
 
WHEREAS, the 2001 Comprehensive Plan or Master Plan for the City has categorized streets 
and arterials within the municipal boundaries as primary, secondary and tertiary; and  
 
WHEREAS, as defined, secondary and tertiary streets serve primarily residential areas only; and 
 
WHEREAS, they are further defined as “Local Residential Streets” by the Master Plan which 
are internal streets within a neighborhood that provides access to residential lots and are arranged 
to discourage most through traffic, except that which is directly related to the area and not 
located in an “urban district”; and 
 
WHEREAS, Local Residential Streets have been investigated, examined, driven, inspected by 
the City; and  
 
WHEREAS, those “Local Residential Streets” are utilized by buses of the public school system, 
access for children and families, are subject to animal crossings and other unanticipated special 
hazards, and, are intended to only provide ingress and egress to residents from arterials and 
collectors; and  
 
WHEREAS, Sec. 12.03.032 of the City’s Code of Ordinances provides that a speed in excess of 
20 miles per hour, when posted, on a designated “Local Residential Street” is considered prima 
facie evidence that the speed is not reasonable and prudent under the circumstances and that the 
speed is unlawful; and 
 
WHEREAS, considering all of the above and, after having observed traffic conditions and 
special hazards conditions thereon, the City has determined that a reasonable and prudent speed 
under the existing conditions on “Local Residential Streets” is 30 miles per hour. 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
WILLOW PARK, TEXAS: 
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SECTION 1.  AUTHORIZATION 
 
The Mayor, or his designee, is hereby authorized and directed to implement the applicable 
provisions of this ordinance as relates to the enforcement of the speed zones contained herein, 
within the municipal boundaries of the City of Willow Park, Texas. 
 
SECTION 2.  AMENDMENT 
 
Chapter 12 “Traffic and Vehicles”, Article 12.03 “Operation of Vehicles”, Division 2. “Speed 
Limits,” Section 12.03.031 and Section 12.03.032 are hereby amended in their entirety to read as 
follows: 
 
“Sec. 12.03.031 Maximum speed generally 
 
 (a) Reasonable and prudent speed required.  No person shall ride or drive any animal or 
operate a vehicle on any street, alley or highway in the city limits at a speed greater than is 
reasonable and prudent under the conditions and having regard for the actual and potential 
hazards then existing.  In every event, speed shall be so controlled as may be necessary to avoid 
colliding with any person, vehicle or other conveyance on or entering a highway in compliance 
with legal requirements, and it shall be the duty of all persons to use due care. 
 
(b) General speed limit on streets and alleys.  If any person shall operate or drive any motor 
vehicle or other vehicle within the corporate limits of the city on any street or highway at a 
greater speed than thirty (30) miles per hour, or in any alley or park at a greater speed than 
fifteen (15) miles per hour, it shall be prima facie evidence of violation of this section, unless 
signs are erected designating another speed limit.  It shall not be necessary that speed limit signs 
be posted except as to speed limits of more or less than 30 miles per hour on a public street and 
as to speed limits of more or less than 15 miles per hour on an alley or park road.   
 
Sec. 12.03.032 Speed limit on local residential streets   
 
No person shall drive or operate a motor vehicle on a designated “local residential street” at a 
speed greater than is reasonable and prudent under the conditions and having regard for the 
actual and potential hazards then existing.  A speed in excess of 30 miles an hour, on a 
designated “local residential street” as identified in the traffic schedules adopted by the city, is 
considered prima facie evidence that the speed is not reasonable and prudent under the 
circumstances and that the speed is unlawful.   It shall not be necessary that speed limit signs be 
posted except as to speed limits of more or less than 30 miles per hour on a designated “local 
residential street.”” 
 
SECTION 3.  RECITALS 
 
The City Council hereby finds and declares all precatory language herein to be true and correct 
and approves and adopts the same herein as part of this Resolution. 
 
SECTION 4.  PENALTY 
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A violation of any provision of this Ordinance shall be punishable by a fine of not less than $1.00 
nor more than $200.00 upon conviction. 
 
SECTION 5.  SEVERABLILITY 
 
If for any reason any section, paragraph, subdivision, clause, phrase or provision of this Ordinance 
shall be held invalid, it shall not affect any valid provisions of this or any other Ordinance of the 
City of Willow Park to which these rules and regulations relate. 
 
SECTION 6.  REPEAL OF CONFLICTING ORDINANCES 
 
All Ordinances in conflict herewith be and the same are hereby repealed to the extent of such 
conflict. 
 
SECTION 7.  EFFECTIVE DATE 
 
This Ordinance shall be effective on or after its publication in a newspaper of general publication 
stating its purpose and penalty. 
 
 
PASSED AND APPROVED this ______ day of July, 2018. 
 
______________________________ 
Doyle Moss, Mayor 

 
ATTEST: 
 
___________________________________ 
   Alicia Smith TRMC, City Secretary 
 
 
 
 
The Willow Park City Council is acting on Ordinance No. 765-18, did on the _____ day of July 
2018 vote as follows: 
 
    FOR             AGAINST             ABSTAIN 
 
Doyle Moss   _____  _____   _____ 
Norman Hogue, Place 1 _____  _____   _____ 
Amy Fennell, Place 2  _____  _____   _____ 
Greg Runnebaum, Place 3 _____  _____   _____ 
Lea Young, Place 4  _____  _____   _____  
Bruce Williams, Place 5 _____  _____   _____ 

 



INTEGRITY
EXCELLENCE

TRUST

325.695.1070
817.594.9880

info@jacobmartin.com
www.jacobmartin.com

3465 Curry Lane
Abilene, TX 76906

1508 Santa Fe, Suite 203
Weatherford, TX 76086

TBPE Firm #: 2448       |       TBAE Firm #: BR 2261       |       TBPLS Firm #: 10024300 – Abilene       |       TBPLS Firm #: 10193992 - Weatherford

June 26, 2018

Mr. Bryan Grimes
City Administrator
City of Willow Park
516 Ranch House Road
Willow Park, Texas 76087

Re: Pump Station & Tank Improvements 

Dear Mr. Grimes:

We have reviewed the bids for the above referenced project.  There were two bids received 
and accepted.  The low bid was provided by TTE, LLC. in the amount of $312,705.00 for Base Bid 
Schedule A and $69,100.00 for Base Bid Schedule B.  Base Bid A included pump station and tank 
improvements at the Well 9 site and Base Bid B included a tank replacement at the Willow 
Springs Oaks site.  We find no reason to disqualify the low bidder and recommend award to 
TTE,  LLC for the combined bid of $381,805.00.  I have attached the bid tab for your review.

Additionally, a change order has been negotiated with TTE, LLC to revise the ground storage 
tank and building components of Base Bid A and some associated items for a net reduction to 
the proposed contract of $66,900.00.  This would result in a total contract amount of 
$314,905.00.  It is our recommendation to approve this change order (draft copy attached) as 
part of the award.

Once Council determines which alternates to accept, we will begin preparing executable contract 
documents.  Please feel free to contact me if you have any questions or concerns. 
Sincerely,

JACOB | MARTIN

Derek Turner, P.E.
Firm No. F-2448

Enclosures

mailto:info@jacobmartin.com
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